Buyer: Brenda Sensibaugh

AMENDED
6203 OF

Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 02/06/20

4 | Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, and ) Deweese Sand & Gravel | Ed Broadfoot & Sons Sand Emme Sand & Gravel, Inc.
% Surfacing Gravel Armstrong Rentals, LLC | Atkinson Sand & Gravel, Inc|D & L Sand and Gravel LLC & Gravel Elkhorn Sand & Gravel LLC '
Description Qty UOM| Unit Price E);erir::ied Unit Price Exs;inc(fd Unit Price E);erir::ied Unit Price Exs;inc(fd Unit Price E);erir::ied Unit Price E);erir(\:ied Unit Price Exs;inc(fd

1 (oo S ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 1200 | TN |$ 3000 $ 36,000.00 s - s - $ - $ - $ - $ -
I A AR 1500 | TN |$  27.50| $ 41,250.00 s - s - $ - s - $ - $ -
3 [P L vARNOR COAT GRAVEL 1500 | TN |8 27.25| $ 40,875.00 s - s - $ - $ - $ - $ -
4 e Ty 1500 | TN |$  26.25| $ 39375.00 s - s - s - s - s - $ -
5 |DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 2800 | ™| nosd | s ! s ] s ] s . $ . $ -|'s  1565| $ 43820.00
6 |wyer oMIOF STANTON 100 |TN| Nemd | s - s - s $ - M P M
7 |Awvaz 06T 1 AND 32— 2200 |TN| Nod |§ - s - s M P P -
e s [ oo [+ P - - T - c
10 g'sg agli'gvagRAVEL 500 | TN | NoBid | - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
1 EEESLE$'$L“§%GRAVEL 300 TN | NoBid | $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -|'s 1510|$ 453000
12 | onam L 1000 | TN | NoBid | $ - $ - $ s 1121| s 1121000 $ - $ - $ -
15 |PIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL 700 | v | nosd | s l s ] s ] $ -|'s  2125| $14,875.00 $ - $ -
14| v 14 MPGO 311 AURORA 1000 | TN | NoBd | s - $ - $ -|s  9s5|s 955000 $ - $ - $ -
N 515 PR IR N YA ) R Y I Sy A )
R O I ) N I e S )
il ey 500 |TN| NoBid | s - $ - $ - $ -|$  25.00| $12,500.00 $ - $ -
1o | LoD 1420 | TN |$  19.00| $ 26,980.00 $ - $ -|'s  1384| $ 10965280 $ - $ - $ -
20 gEJE?\‘\Q’LNEARR%W GRAVEL 680 ™ No Bid $ - $ - $ -l s 1250 $ 8,500.00 | $ 15.56 | $10,580.80 $ - $ -
2L | rYohs PGS 1IN OF ST PAUL 1000 [TN| NoBd | $ - s - s -|'s  1135] $ 11350.00 s - s - $ -
22 | \Wvo5 MPZ3 1MIN OF ROCKVILLE 1100 | TN | MNoBid |8 . ® . ® _ s S 1877 2064790 ¢ - > -
24 H'ASFI RSISDBEU'gg?(fF?;VEL 2000 | TN | NoBid | - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
25 |51 5 DEICIG GRAVEL 1000 [TN| NoBd | $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
26 E:ASAE ﬁ%ﬁg‘g GRAVEL 3000 | TN | NoBid | s - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
27 |1 S DEICING SRAVEL 3000 [TN| NoBd | $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
28 Z'LSLTASI\IQE"igiIDCOAT GRAVEL 1200 | TN | NoBd | 8 - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
29 |DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 2000 | TN | NoBid |8 - $ - s - $ - $ - $ - $ -
30 Z'Ff;vsfgy[?;%%“ GRAVEL 2000 | TN | NoBid | - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
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Buyer: Brenda Sensibaugh

AMENDED
6203 OF

Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 02/06/20

z ArmorcoatGraveI,gs;z;wc?nﬁg\r/:\lje\llwndrowGfave'vand Armstrong Rentals, LLC [ Atkinson Sand & Gravel, Inc| D & L Sand and Gravel LLC Deweese Sand & Gravel | Ed Broadéogtrfvifns Sand Elkhorn Sand & Gravel LLC Emme Sand & Gravel, Inc.
3

Description Qty UOM| Unit Price E);erir::ied Unit Price Exs;inc(fd Unit Price E);erir::ied Unit Price Exs;inc(fd Unit Price E);erir::ied Unit Price E);erir(\:ied Unit Price Exs;inc(fd
2 |owroonpsaME o RUSIVLE | 100 | V| NoBd | - L s : M A S
SR O O g | w0 [ | wome [5 . s : . P - s
3 |nwvssonper L sor Rusvie | 1500 | V| Mosd | - L s : M A S
A e R D . s : . P - s
% |iwvsss upLa1 Jom S OF Criapron | 2000 | V| MoBd | - L s : M A S
® | va7 wpios S oF osikosr | 0 | ™| Nomd |8 - - s : A S S
% |wroopaominorMrcrer, | 1500 | ™| Mosd | - L s : M A S
a1 | 5 ARMOR CORT GRAVEL 1500 | TN | NoBid |8 - $ - s - $ $ - $ - $ -
42 all?lzflAr\;aF’:ggg;:l\i?\lTOGFR&\:/g#TSBLUFF 2000 | TN | NoBd | 8 ) s . ® . s ° ~ ¢ _ s 7
43 E:/?II(:ZAMRF’:AZ?F;A%%EERS?:\(I)ETLTSBLUFF 1500 | TN | NoBid | 8 - $ ) $ - ® i - $ - s -
aq |DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 3000 | TN | NoBid |8 - $ - s - $ $ - $ - s -
% |rwv7 Mo aME OF crappeL | 200 | V| MoBd | - L s : M A S
47|71 3 125 OF KIVBALL 2000 |TN| Nomd |8 - - s : A A S
B e R N D s s : . - s
% |NORTH PLATTE 150 vaRD 1000 || Nomd |8 - - s : A S S
o ST eOHCRE CRAEL w00 || wosa s s s : . - s
51 2@&532&?\&1@/& 1500 | TN | NoBd | $ - $ . $ - $ $ - $ - $ .
2 DS SgEoe crAvr o0 || wosa s s s : P - s
53_|afoLD Hwvep wPzsL 150 || Nomd |8 - b s : A S S
5|2 Mp1a THIW OF MULLEN S0 |TN| Noed |5 - L M : A S S
5 |orokenBow wesT wvzuperr | S0 | ™| wemd |3 - L - : M S S
o e R R B s s : : r - ©
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Buyer: Brenda Sensibaugh

AMENDED
6203 OF

Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 02/06/20

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, and

z Surfacing Gravel Armstrong Rentals, LLC | Atkinson Sand & Gravel, Inc|D & L Sand and Gravel LLC Deweese Sand & Gravel | Ed Broadéogtrfvifns Sand Elkhorn Sand & Gravel LLC Emme Sand & Gravel, Inc.
5

Description Qty UOM| Unit Price E);erir::ied Unit Price Exs;inc(fd Unit Price E);erir::ied Unit Price Exs;inc(fd Unit Price E);erir::ied Unit Price E);erir(\:ied Unit Price Exs;inc(fd
63 |20 OWINDROW SRAVEL 750 | TN| NoBd | $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ - $ -
65 |2 SINDROW GRAVEL 750 | TN | NoBid | s - $ - $ - $ $ - $ - 8 -
o o | [ | e 5 s . : c P -
67_|ARNOLD o2 MPZo1 - 75 | ™| Nosd |5 - s s : M M S
68 | ANSELMO vz WPZST 70 | TN] Nomd |5 - s s s A S S
69| BROKEN BOW w21 PGB 0 | TN| Nemd |5 - s - s - s s - s - s -
0| R e Ve 750 | TN | NoBid | s - s - s - ] $ - $ - $ -
o SRS [ | o [+ i F : P - -
T2 | R v CRAVEL 750 | TN | NoBid | s - s - s - ] $ - $ - $ -
ol P v e L IR DR i F : . - -
7 3@152“&252@%“.%Rg\é%TApLETON 500 | TN | NoBid |8 ) s . ® . s ° _ ¢ _ s 7
" S:/?/I(S mTEGR:%VI\\/III?I\'?S\é%ULLEN 1000 | TN | NoBid | $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ - $ -
R e I D - - : . - .
79 | \ver MPLTS 1SWIN OF HyANNIS 1000 | TN | NoBid |8 . $ . ® - $ * _ s - : -
R e e N D - - : . - T
83 | SPRINGIEW vARD 800 |TN| NoBid | s -|'s 1450 $ 11,600.00 s - s s -|s  1686| s 1348800 s -
Ba | O o AVEL 1500 | TN | NoBid | $ -] 990| 1485000 %  9.50| $ 14,250.00 $ $ -|'s  1465| s 21975.00 $ -
T 2000 | TN | NoBid | 8 -|'s  2000|$ 4000000|$ 12.25| $ 2450000 $ $ -|$  2230| $ 44,600.00 $ -
86 | QoS DEICING GRAVEL 500 |TN| NoBid | s -|'s  2400| $ 1200000| 5 17.70| $ 8850.00 s s - s - $ -
87 | D SRAVEL 2000 | TN| NoBd | $ -|'s  3000|$6000000|8s 2095 $ 41,900.00 $ $ - $ - $ -
85 | w11 MP147 AT ATKINSON 50 |TN| MNewd |5  -|s  800|s 400000 s * S fF en)s e M
60 |DIST 8 DECING GRAVEL 50 | v | nosid | s |s 1025 s s12500 s ] s s -|s 1550|$ 775000(% 1105|$ 552500
b EIC?;'I'BHD;’?I’\\I‘SEGRRQ/IEDLHWYZM 700 | TN | NoBid |3 -|s 1100 s 7,700.00 $ - $ $ -|s 1635 s 1144500 1105| $ 773500
o1 |D5T BDEICNG CRAVEL 1000 [ TN | NoBid | 8 -|s 1800 $ 18,000.00 $ - $ $ - $ - $ -
o2 |DST B DEICING GRAVEL 2000 | TN | NoBid | $ -|'s 1900 $ 38,000.00 s - $ $ - $ -|$  11.30] $ 22,600.00
93 ?f\lgg'iﬂ\l‘f GRAVEL 1000 | TN | NoBid | $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ - $ -
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Buyer: Brenda Sensibaugh

AMENDED
6203 OF

Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 02/06/20

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, and

z Surfacing Gravel Armstrong Rentals, LLC | Atkinson Sand & Gravel, Inc|D & L Sand and Gravel LLC Deweese Sand & Gravel | Ed Broadéogtrfvifns Sand Elkhorn Sand & Gravel LLC Emme Sand & Gravel, Inc.
5
Description Qty UOM| Unit Price E);erir(\:ied Unit Price Exs;inc?d Unit Price E);erir(\:ied Unit Price Exs;inc?d Unit Price E);erir(\:ied Unit Price E);erir(\:ied Unit Price Exs;inc?d

o4 |OST B DEICING GRAVEL 1000 | TN | NoBid |8 -|s 89| s 8900.00 s - $ - $ -|'s 1200| $ 1200000 70| s 970000
a5 | A A o RAVEL 2000 | TN | NoBid | $ -|'s  1150| $ 23000.00 $ - $ - $ -|s 17.20| $ 3440000| s 1380 $ 27,600.00
96 | Ry SRAVEL 1000 | TN| NoBd | $ -|'$ 1400| $ 1400000|s 11.10| $ 11,100.00 $ - $ -|s 1535| s 1535000 $ -
9T | RIVAN 1200 | TN | NoBid | $ -|'s 2000|$3600000(% 2045| $ 2454000 $ - $ - $ - $ -
B | G 700 | TN| NoBd | s -|'s  1200] s 8400.00 s - $ - $ -|s  1320's 924000 $ -
90 | oER 350 |TN| NoBd | -|'s 1150 s 402500 $ - $ - $ -|s 1280 s 448000 $ -
100 D 350 | TN| NoBid | $ -|'s  9s0|s 332500 s - $ - $ -|s 1680 s 588000(s 1075|s 376250
T AV S 7200 |TN| NoBd | -|'s  1312|s 918400 $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
102 D R o oy 600 |TN| NoBd | -|$ 2625 $1575000|s  16.90| $ 10,140.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
108 [ R O A ks 600 |TN| NoBd | $ -|s 1970| s 1182000 s 1650 $ 9,900.00 $ - $ -|s 1680| s 10,080.00 $ -
104 | o e | ENTINE 1200 | TN | NoBid | $ -|s 1980| $ 2376000|s  1200| $ 14,400.00 $ - $ -|s  2130| s 25560.00 $ -
105 | O ! 200 |TN| NoBd |8 -|s o18|s 3600 $ s s s o20|s 4000 $ -|s  o1s|s 3000
106 |OFION 2 DR O e TON 200 | TN| NoBid | s -|s o1|s seo0ls o1s|s  3000| s s -|s o20|s 4000|$ o017  3400|$ 015|s  30.00
107 |G O D O e TON 200 |TN| NoBd |8 -|s o18|s 3e00ls o01s|s  3000| $ s -|s o020|s a000ols o017|$  3400|s o01s|s 3000
108 | R e N 200 | TN| NoBd | s -|s  o18|s 3600 s s s -|s o20|s 4000|$ o017  3400|$ 015|s  30.00
108 [ R EELEY 1200 | TN | NoBid | $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -|'s 1480| s 17,760.00

Total $184.480.00 $360.583.00 $159.640.00 $ 6528280 $94.334.30 $222.650.00 $157.027.50

Payment Terms Net 30 100 30 Net 40 100 30 090 0 0 No discounts given
Delivery Days ARO 14 15 60 30

Comments

Lines 105-108 are per
Ton/Mile

Lines 106-108 are per Ton
Mile

Lines 105-108:
.$15/Ton Mile * 10 Miles =
$1.50/Ton
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Buyer: Brenda Sensibaugh

AMENDED
6203 OF

Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 02/06/20

?) Armor Coat Gravel, gsi(f:;r::?neravel, Windrow Gravel, and Hooker Bros Sand & Lyman Richey Corporation Mid-Nobraska Aggregate

2 g Gravel Gravel Inc Island Landhandlers Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc. L & L Gravel L.P. Stewart and Sons dba Central Sand & Gravel Matteo Sand & Gravel Inc. Overton Sand & Gravel Co

- Company

Description Qty UOM| Unit Price Exs,;inc(ied Unit Price Exs;inc?d Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price Exs;inc?d Unit Price E);erir(\:ied Unit Price Exs;inc?d Unit Price Exs;inc?d Unit Price E);erir(\:ied Unit Price Exs;inc?d

1 [oiST L ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 1200 | TN s - s - $ - s -| noBid | s -|'s  2610] s3320.00 s - s - $ -
2 gflkssTTlJéwf\)/vRvics)ingg\/EL 1500 | TN $ - $ - $ . $ -| NoBid |s -|s  2194| $32,91000 $ . $ - $ -
3 Sﬁ_hlvsirﬁggg OAT GRAVEL 1500 | TN $ - $ - $ - $ -|'s  4725| s 70,875.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -
4| 3CT HWiY 8 AND B PAWNEE CITY 1500 | TN $ - $ - s - $ -|'s  5375| $ 80625.00 s - s - s . s ]
5 3:};? szﬂé)DR COAT GRAVEL 2800 | TN $ - $ -|s 1628|s 4558400 $ -| Nosid |s - $ -|'$  2104] $ 58912.00 $ - $ .
6 551%’2?%8? gg:NTT%iAVEL 1500 | TN $ - $ - $ . $ -| NoBid | s - $ -|'s 1680| s 2520000 $ B s .
’ 3'@1&??@? TzﬁiﬁTD%F;AVEL 2200 | TN $ - $ - $ - $ -| Nosid | - $ -|s 1878 $ 41,316.00 $ - $ -
8 5513%“.”3%?%@;;(3?& 780 | TN $ - $ - $ - $ -| NoBid |s - $ -|'s  17.28| s 12960.00 s - $ .
8 | FULLERTON MANT vagD 50 |TN|s  -|s  -|s 1475|s 737500 s - s | wse |5 - s - s - s - s -
10 g':; o DEICINS ORAVEL 500 | TN $ . $ -|s 1100|s 550000 $ -| NoBid | - $ - $ -|s 1950|s 9,750.00 $ .
1 EEQQLEE'&\NR%GRAVEL 300 ™ $ - $ -|s  1425(s 427500 $ - No Bid $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
12 | N SrAvEL 1000 | TN|$  970|s 970000|s 985 985000 $ - $ -| Nomid | - $ - $ -|s 1850| $ 18,500.00 $ -
13 E(IJSJP“C?%CQ?QS RAVEL 700 | TN $ - $ -|s 1410|$ 987000 $ - NoBid | $ - $ - $ -|s  1850| $ 12,950.00 $ -
1 o oA 1000 | TN|$  988|s 088000/ $  925(s 9.250.00 s - s | noBd | s - $ - s ; s ] s ]
15 JDéSTT; ii'g'g‘fzfﬂmfémw 1200 | TN |$  1084[ $13,00800|$  13.75| $16,500.00 $ - $ -| NoBid |8 - $ - $ - $ - $ -
16 | e CRAVEL HWYS 50 |TN|$ 1580|$ 7,00000( $ 1650 $ 8,250.00 s - s -] NoBid |8 - s - s ; s R s ]
17 E(IJSJP“C/T?L\A $§R%OAT GRAVEL 500 | TN $ -|$ 1850|$ 925000($ 1675|$  8375.00 $ - NoBid | $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
18 | e NGS s00 |TN|$ 1052| s 526000 $ - $ - $ -| Nomid | - $ - $ -|s  2100| $ 10,500.00 $ -
19 | wvoed wer ami N OF ReDcLoup | 1920 | TN | 1469 52085080 s - s - s | nese |5 s - s - s - s -
20 |DIST A WNDROW GRAVEL 680 | TN |[s 1073 s 7,206.40 $ s 1495|s 10,166.00 $ -| NoBid | - $ - $ -|s 1850| $ 12,580.00 $ .
21 | \ava01 PSS LMIN OF ST PAUL 1000 | TN |8 957]$ 9,570.00 $ s s - $ -| NoBd [ - $ - $ -|'s 20,00 $ 20,000.00 $ -
22 aﬁlg;x,:sgﬁfxfg@‘;%cwm& 1100 | TN $ . $ -|s 1450|s 15950.00 $ -| NoBid | - $ - $ -|'s  2000| $ 22,000.00 $ .
23| lvoa MP320 1w W OF LOUP CITY 50 | TN $ - $ S| 8 1375|$8 756250 $ -| NoBd [ - $ - $ -|'$ 2200 $ 12,100.00 $ -
2 | IARRISBURG YARD - 2000 | TN s - s - s - s | mse |5 - s - s - s - s -
25 | CHAPPELL YARD 100 | TN s - s - s - s | wse |5 - s - s - s - s -
29 ﬁfg@;gﬁ" sz%OAT GRAVEL 2000 | TN $ - $ -|$ 2155|$  43,100.00 $ - No Bid $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
30 ggzﬁfgylf&i%” GRAVEL 2000 | TN $ . $ -|s 2455|s 4910000 $ .| NoBid |s - $ . $ . s . 3 .
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Buyer: Brenda Sensibaugh

AMENDED
6203 OF

Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 02/06/20

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, and

Hooker Bros Sand &

?, Surfacin Lyman Richey Corporation Mid-Nebraska Aggregate

2 g Gravel Gravel Inc Island Landhandlers Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc. L &L Gravel L.P. Stewart and Sons  |dba Central Sand & Gravel Matteo Sand & Gravel Inc. Overton Sand & Gravel Co

- Company

Description Qty UOM| Unit Price Exs,;inc(ied Unit Price Exs;inc?d Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price Exs;inc?d Unit Price E);erir(\:ied Unit Price Exs;inc?d Unit Price Exs;inc?d Unit Price E);erir(\:ied Unit Price Exs;inc?d

31 ﬁ{,svlfo‘m?jtfﬁfo?@: f'D‘RON 4000 | TN $ - $ -|$ 3100[$ 124,000.00 $ - NoBid | $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
32 aﬁISOASFggF;ﬁﬁEAngRS\S/EbILLE 1000 N $ - $ -1$ 3250| $ 32,500.00 $ - No Bid $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
3|7 MPLL0 26MI S oF Craweorp | 300 | ™ s - s - s - s | wsa | s - s - s - s
3 _|wyos0wpor 1MIS OF RUSHVILE | 1900 | T s s -|s ausls s s | wsa |s s s s - s -
35_|rwvsss P14 10w OF Criapron | 20| ™ s s -|s woo)s 200000 s -] wao |s s s - N N
35| wyoes wpast 26 s OF Criapron | 2000 | ™ s s -|s 3ols o200 s | wsa |s s N s - s -
37|26 MpaB owiw OF LiSCo w00 | ™ s - s - s - s | wog |s s - s - s A
38| wyo7 MP105 oMl S OF OSKosH | 200 | ™ s - s - s — s -] waw |s s N s - N
38| wyor Mp1an 1 S OF OSkos | %90 | ™ s - s - s - s | wsa | s - s - s - s
40 aﬁlngh?g%F;fhﬁ?\chiRhﬁl\;i;ELL 1500 N $ - $ -1$ 17.10( $  25,650.00 $ - No Bid $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
4 |oARmisURG vARD 1500 | T s - s - s - s | wsa | s s - s - s
42 5{/31751A§£Ooifmﬁfgg#rsmupp 2000 | TN $ 3 $ - $ - $ -| NoBid | $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
| wver Mp21 awiw oF scotrsewuge | 1500 | TN s s - s : s | wsa |s s N s - s -
R R I c - s s ww |5 C T T T
48 3{?%%%&?&%&3% YARD 1000 | TN $ - $ -|$ 1000|$ 10,000.00 $ - NoBid | $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
49 zg;fHDF’Ellill[\‘&?gé¥§;D 1000 N $ - $ -1$ 1050 $  10,500.00 $ - No Bid $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
O S AN 1000 | TN $ - $ -|s  oo|s 900000 $ | nosid | s $ - $ - $ - s .
51 REngsaglls.?&F;;VEL 1500 TN $ - $ -8 1115 $  16,725.00 $ - No Bid $ $ - $ - $ -ls 11.20| $ 16,800.00
52_|OCONTO MANT YARD. - 1500 | TN 8 - $ - s - $ -| NoBd [ $ - $ - s -|'s 1120 $ 16,800.00
53 /IZIL’SI:IFC?LBE&(\:AII’\;SZGI\FEI/;\ZISE; 1500 N $ - $ -1$ 1420 $  21,300.00 $ - No Bid $ $ - $ - $ -1s 1450 $ 21,750.00
54 SL?J}EEE,EQQ‘,G\,VGERS‘.‘FV&;,YZ MP277 1500 | TN $ - $ -|$ 1440|$ 21,600.00 $ - NoBid | $ $ - $ - $ -|s 1075| $ 16,125.00
55 a{/?/lzehaslgg\‘f\M?\ilAgskﬁuLLEN 500 N $ - $ -1$ 1487 $ 7,435.00( $ 1150 $ 5,750.00 No Bid $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
56 SL,SSTLGECF:M%?S%O,\,T%?RAVEL 500 | TN $ - $ -|s 14858 742500 $ - NoBid | $ $ - $ - $ -|s 1490| s 745000
57 SEJKGEQR%O\AF;VSCE)QI ﬁ\?{é\zlEr\;pzw 500 N $ - $ -1$ 17.90( $ 8,950.00 $ - No Bid $ $ - $ - $ -1s 14.15| $ 7,075.00
58| Vo1 MP12 il N OF LEXNGTON 1000 | TN 8 - $ - $ - s -| MNoBd |3 $ - s - $ -|'s  1050| $ 10500.00
59 aﬁl;ﬁygizcnﬁﬁré?&\:/ghm 1000 | TN $ ) $ - $ - $ - NoBid | $ $ - $ - $ -|s 1350| $ 13500.00
60 a{,ﬂf Qsﬂg?,ﬁf) ﬁgﬁ?ﬁﬁ"m 1000 | TN $ - $ -|$ 1887|$ 1887000($  1450( $ 14,500.00| NoBid | $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
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Buyer: Brenda Sensibaugh

AMENDED
6203 OF

Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 02/06/20

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, and

Hooker Bros Sand &

?, Surfacin Lyman Richey Corporation Mid-Nebraska Aggregate

2 g Gravel Gravel Inc Island Landhandlers Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc. L & L Gravel L.P. Stewart and Sons dba Central Sand & Gravel Matteo Sand & Gravel Inc. Overton Sand & Gravel Co

- Company

Description Qty UOM| Unit Price Exs,;inc(ied Unit Price Exs;inc?d Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price Exs;inc?d Unit Price E);erir(\:ied Unit Price Exs;inc?d Unit Price Exs;inc?d Unit Price E);erir(\:ied Unit Price Exs;inc?d

61 ﬁ{fvi;"hv,,'g‘;’ IRZO,X:/ ,f gé\,(,EF',‘LATTE 2000 | TN $ - $ -|$ 1375|$ 27,500.00 $ - No Bid $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
62 aﬁlg;ﬂg‘ggg‘g’éﬁg\/ﬂ 2000 | TN $ - $ -|$ 1510|$ 3020000 $ - NoBid | $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
63 gﬁlev,ﬁQ‘UDRRGO mSSAVEL 750 ™ $ - $ -|$ 1630 $ 12,225.00 $ - No Bid $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
64 2@@%%53!&2’;\/& 750 | TN $ - $ -|s  1150|$ 862500 $ - NoBid | $ $ - $ . $ -|s 1105| s 828750
65 S,LSRTGGEV,\YITNEARR%W GRAVEL 750 ™ $ - $ -|$ 1100 $  8250.00 $ - No Bid $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
66 | OCONTO IO HWY21 AND 40 750 | TN $ - $ - $ - $ -| NoBd s $ - $ - s <|s  1125] s s4arso
67 SSJSLVS”S\Z?S;V ,\f;;?{ﬂ 375 ™ $ - $ -|$ 1720 $  6,450.00 $ - No Bid $ $ - $ - $ -|$ 1425 $ 534375
68 /'ZL‘SSTEGL%N,_?VTILB;NM%F;SA;/ EL 750 | TN $ - $ -|s 1280 % 960000 $ - NoBid | $ $ - $ . $ s 1400| $ 1050000
69 Sﬁgﬁg’d'@‘g@‘i}’gﬁ?ﬁ mE{ss 750 ™ $ - $ -|$ 1520 $  11,400.00 $ - No Bid $ $ - $ - $ -|$ 1175 $ 881250
70 aﬁlgﬂ'gﬁiﬂm&m\/ﬂ 750 | TN $ - $ -|s 1160|$ 870000($ 1150 $ 862500 NoBid | $ $ - $ . $ . $ .
71 a{,?,izssv,\\/,m)oiav%/ SE?: EE'F;L AND 2000 | TN $ - $ -|$ 1250 $ 25000.00 $ - NoBid | $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
e ILDIIES><T|NGGV¥g‘r\? \F:EF\?EJGRAVEL 70 | N $ - $ - $ - $ -| NoBid | s $ - $ - $ -|s  so0|s 600000
3 a{,ﬂf ,\\;VF!T??'RPJ,V v\c,; Fgﬁv,\beLEN 2500 | TN $ - $ -|$ 1775|$ 4437500($  11.00| $ 27,500.00| NoBid | $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
74 aﬁlg;ﬂs&iﬂmiﬁ@;&u 2000 | TN $ - $ -|s  1592|$ 31,840.00 $ - NoBid | $ $ - $ . $ . $ .
75 a{,%,i&msg%%‘gM?EQﬁ';LEmN 1000 | TN $ - $ -|$ 1760|$ 17,60000($ 1150 $ 11,500.00| NoBid | $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
76 aﬁlg;’m‘;@%ﬁlﬁg\é? APLETON 500 | TN $ - $ -|s 1542|$ 771000|$ 1300|$ 650000 NoBid | $ $ - $ . $ . $ .
” a{,ﬂf A\;\QTEGREJVV\XICJ\EQQ\;%ULLEN 1000 | TN $ - $ -|$ 1910|$ 1910000 $  1250( $ 12,500.00| NoBid | $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
78 aﬁl&ﬂg‘g@%ﬁﬁf@fﬁw 1000 | TN $ - $ -|$ 2008 $ 20080.00 $ - NoBid | $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
79 ﬁ{,ﬂ;"ﬂg‘fﬁ‘i‘;ﬁﬁ‘g’f }:YANNIS 1000 | TN $ - $ -|$ 2365|% 2365000($ 1650 $ 16,500.00| NoBid | $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
80 aﬁl&ﬂg‘%ﬁ%‘gﬁfﬁ:&w 1000 | TN $ - $ -|s 2070|$ 20700.00 $ - NoBid | $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
B | a5 MB131 W D OF ELWOOD 150 | TN $ - $ - $ - $ -| NoBd | $ - $ - $ -|'s  9.00| s 10350.00
82 a{,ﬂg m;‘g fg\)ﬁ’ﬁ%@j;bm AL 700 | TN $ - $ -|s 2350 $ 16450.00 $ - NoBid | $ $ - $ . $ . $ .
83 SIF,S,;SGD\;E'LCV'VN\?AGR?VEL 800 ™ $ - $ -|$ 1450 $  11,600.00 $ - No Bid $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
84 Zﬁ;@g&ﬁ”ﬁg;’wﬂ 1500 | TN $ - $ -|$ 1200|$ 18000.00 $ - NoBid | $ $ - $ . $ . $ .
85 Sﬁ_T,EzTDlEE 'L\'ngRAVEL 2000 | TN $ - $ -|$ 1500 $ 30,000.00 $ - No Bid $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
86 gg;f?f;%'”e CGRAVEL 500 | TN $ - $ -|s 1775|$  8875.00 $ - NoBid | $ $ - $ . $ . $ .
87 ag:”\a ,E,I\‘C L’f;g RAVEL 2000 | TN $ - $ -|$ 2250 $ 45000.00 $ - No Bid $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
85 | WY1 MP147 AT ATKINSON 0 | ™ s - s - s , s | tosa s s - s - s - s -
8 |SPENCERVARD 500 | ™ s - s - s - s | nosa s N s - s - s -
9% 3§;$HDSEFI>%|ATSE(;R\2/R% HWY281 700 | TN $ - $ - $ - $ -| NoBid |8 $ - $ - $ - $ -
91 S{fgﬁgf‘cs'c’,“ﬁﬁiﬁt’;; 1000 | TN $ - $ -|$ 1150 $  11,500.00 $ - No Bid $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
92 SERTT?ETE;C\'&&SRAVEL 2000 | TN $ - $ -|$ 1070|$ 2140000 $ - NoBid | $ $ - $ . $ . $ .
93 ?L\SYT,_ZS e,f,'qNDG GRAVEL 1000 | TN $ - $ -|$ 1150 $  11,500.00 $ - No Bid $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
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Buyer: Brenda Sensibaugh

AMENDED
6203 OF

Department of Transportation

Opening Date: 02/06/20

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, and

Hooker Bros Sand &

?: Surfacin Lyman Richey Corporation Mid-Nebraska Aggregate
2 g Gravel Gravel Inc Island Landhandlers Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc. L &L Gravel L.P. Stewart and Sons dba Central Sand & Gravel Matteo Sand & Gravel Inc. Overton Sand & Gravel Co
= Company
Description Qty UOM| Unit Price Exéerinc(ied Unit Price Exéerinc(ied Unit Price | Extended Price |  Unit Price Exéerinc(ied Unit Price E);erir(\:ied Unit Price Exéerinc(ied Unit Price Exéerinc(ied Unit Price E);erir(\:ied Unit Price Exéerinc(ied
0q [T BDECING GRAVEL 1000 | TN $ - $ - s - $ | NoBid | s - $ - s - s - s -
o5 [ A AT RAVEL 2000 | TN $ - $ - $ - $ -] NoBd |s - $ - $ - s - $ -
96 | e AVEL 1000 | TN $ - $ -|s  1175|s 1175000 $ -| NoBd |s - $ - $ - $ - $ -
L AV A 1200 | TN $ - $ -|'s 2400|s 28800.00 $ -| Nomid | - $ - $ - $ - $ -
9B [ e kG 700 | TN $ - $ -|s 1075|s 752500 $ -| NoBd |s - $ - $ - $ - $ -
N AV AN, 350 | TN $ - $ -|ls 1075|s 376250 $ -| NoBid | - $ - $ - $ - $ -
100 [P e 30 | TN $ - $ - s - $ -| NoBd |s - $ - s - s - s -
ST AN 700 | TN $ - $ -|s 1150|s  8050.00 $ -| Nomid | - $ - $ - $ - $ -
102 [P R o oy 600 | TN $ - $ -|s 2250|s 13500.00 $ .| NoBid | - $ - $ - $ - $ -
108 | R A ks 600 | TN $ - $ -|s 1950|s 11,700.00 $ -| Nomid | - $ - $ - $ - $ -
104 [ 2 o ORLENTINE 1200 | TN $ - $ -|s 1400|$ 16,800.00 $ .| NoBid | - $ - $ - $ - $ -
105 | O e ! 200 | TN $ -|s o18|s 3600|s o01s|s 30.00 $ -| NoBid | - $ - $ - $ -|s  o20|s 4000
106 [SFHION 2 DR O e TON 200 | TN $ -|s o018|s 3eo0[s o1s|s 30.00 $ -| NoBd |s - $ - $ - $ -|s  o020|s 4000
107 |G O S D GO e TON 200 | TN $ - $ Is  o1s|s 30.00 $ -| Nosid | - $ - $ - $ -|s o20|s 4000
108 |9 O e e N 200 | TN $ - $ -ls  o1s|s 3000($  016($ 3200 NoBd | $ - $ - $ - $ -|s  o020|s 4000
100 | R EELEY 1200 | TN $ - $ -|s 1450|$ 17400003  016|$ 19200| NoBid | $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
Total $83.474.20 $60,547.00 $1.310,900.00 $103.599.00 $151,500.00 $64,230.00 $138.388.00 $118.380.00 $167.891.25
Payment Terms 30 Net 30 100 30 030
Delivery Days ARO 30 As Requested 10 45 30

Comments

Lines 105-108 are per ton
mile
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Buyer: Brenda Sensibaugh AMENDED Opening Date: 02/06/20
6203 OF
Department of Transportation

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, and

3 -
2 Surfacing Gravel Pine Bluffs Gravel & Exc Inc Simon Contractors Stalp Gravel, Inc. Ulrich Gravel Inc Westover Rock & Sand Inc
3
Description Qty UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price E);erir::ied Unit Price E);erir::ied Unit Price EXS‘;?CZEd
DIST 1 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
! |wAHOO YARD 1200 | TN $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
DIST 1 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
2 |EAST JCT HWY 15 AND 92 1500 | TN $ - $ - $ - s . $ .
DIST 1 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
3 |PALMYRA YARD 1500 | TN $ - $ - $ - $ -|'s  4650| $69,750.00
DIST 1 SURFACING GRAVEL
4 |JCT HWY 8 AND 65 PAWNEE CITY 1500 | TN $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
5 |NELIGH YARD 2800 | TN $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
6 |DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 1500 | TN s - s 1's  2500| $37.500.00 R i N -

HWY57 8MI OF STANTON
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
7 |HwY121 JCT 121 AND 32 2200 | TN $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
8 |HWY13 4MI N OF PIERCE 750 | TN $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL

FULLERTON MAINT YARD
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL

10 | OrD MAINT YARD 500 | TN $ - $ - $ -|s 1070| s 535000 $ -

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL

11 |GREELEY YARD 300 | TN $ - $ - $ -|$ 1310|$ 393000 $ .
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL

12 | QT b AUL MANT vARD 1000 | TN $ - $ - $ -|s  1111] s 1112000 $ .
DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL

13 | 5Up CITY YARD 700 | TN $ - $ - $ -|s 1225|s 8575.00 $ -

14 |DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL 1000 | . - s - s - s - s -

HWY14 MP60 3MIS AURORA

DIST 4 DEICING GRAVEL
15 |JCT 34 AND 81 2MI N OF YORK 1200 | TN $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL HWY6
16 |MP219 6MI E OF HASTINGS 500 | TN $ - $ - $ - $ - $ .
DIST 4 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
17 |Loup ciTY YARD 500 | TN $ - $ - $ -|$ 1550|$ 7.,750.00 $ .

18| \Wve MP2LO 6MIE OF HASTINGS s00 | TN s - s - s - s - s -
19 | Vot NP SMINGERED Cloup | 1420 | ™ s - s - s - s - s -
20 | AVENNAYARD N s } s ; s - s - s -
2L | a5t Miss 1w N OF ST PAUL 1000 | TN $ - $ - $ -|'s  1111] s 11,1000 $ -

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
2 HWY58 MP29 1MIN OF ROCKVILLE 1100 ™ $ - $ - $ -8 12.00| $ 13,200.00 $ -

DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
2% |Hwy92 MP320 1MI W OF LOUP CITY 550 | TN $ - $ - $ s 1250 s 687500 $ -

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
24 || ARRISBURG YARD 2000 | TN |$ 1100 $ 2200000|$ 895 $ 17,900.00 $ - $ - $ .

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
25 CHAPPELL YARD 1000 TN [ $ 16.00| $ 16,000.00| $ 15.00| $ 15,000.00 $ - $ - $ -

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
26 | IMBALL YARD 3000 | TN |$ 1100 $ 3300000|$ 1150 $  34,500.00 $ - $ - $ .

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL
27 SIDNEY MAINT YARD 3000 N | $ 1500 $ 45,000.00| $ 17.25| $  51,750.00 $ - $ - $ -

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
28 | oL IANCE YARD 1200 | TN [$ 3500($ 4200000 $ 2210($ 26,520.00 $ - $ - $ ;

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
29 HARRISON YARD 2000 N | $ 35.00| $ 70,000.00( $ 2358| $  47,160.00 $ - $ - $ -

DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
30 CRAWFORD YARD 2000 TN [ $ 35.00| $ 70,000.00( $ 25.06| $ 50,120.00 $ - $ - $ -
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Buyer: Brenda Sensibaugh

AMENDED
6203 OF

Department of Transportation

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, and

z Surfacing Gravel Pine Bluffs Gravel & Exc Inc Simon Contractors Stalp Gravel, Inc. Ulrich Gravel Inc Westover Rock & Sand Inc
5

Description Qty UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price E);erir::ied Unit Price E);erir::ied Unit Price EXS‘;?CZEd
B | A R L ON 4000 | TN |$ 3500 $ 14000000|$  38.00| $ 15200000 $ $ - $ -
B | e e LLE 1000 | TN |$  3500|$ 3500000{$ 3250|$ 32,500.00 $ $ - $ -
B3 | A R wkoRD | 3000 | TN|8  3500| s 10500000 $  2052|$ 6156000 $ $ - $ -
B o o ILLE 1500 | TN |$  3500|$ 5250000 $ 3420|$ 51,300.00 $ $ - $ -
B | O DRON 2000 | TN |$ 3500 $ 7000000|$ 2617|$ 52340.00 $ $ - $ -
B | s o RN 2000 | TN |$ 3500 $ 70,00000|$ 2525\ $ 50,500.00 $ $ - $ -
BT A e e RAvEL 3000 | TN |$ 3500 $ 10500000($ 2260|$ 67,800.00 $ $ - $ -
8| O e osH 2000 | TN |$ 3500|$ 7000000|$ 1813|$  36,260.00 $ $ - $ -
B0 | A O s 3000 | TN |$ 3500 $ 10500000($ 1892|$  56,760.00 $ $ - $ -
O o el L 1500 | TN |$  2800|$ 4200000|$ 1726 $  25890.00 $ $ - $ -
a1 | 5 ARMOR CORT GRAVEL 1500 | TN |$ 2500 $ 37.50000| $  1563|$ 2344500 $ $ - $ -
A e BLUFF | 2000 | TN|s  2800|s 56000008 1655 s 33,0000 $ $ - $ -
s A O e et <mlUre | 1500 | TN|s  2500|s s750000|$ 1375 20,625.00 s s - $ -
aq |DIST 5 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 3000 | TN |$ 1500 $ 4500000| $ 1974|$  59,220.00 $ $ - $ -
a5 | R PELL 2000 | TN |$ 1700 $ 34,00000| $ 1818|$  36,360.00 $ $ - $ -
a6 | A O e L 2000 | TN |$ 1600 $ 3200000| $ 2225 $ 44500.00 $ $ - $ -
T AVt 2000 | TN |$ 1600 $ 3200000|$ 2255 $  45100.00 $ $ - $ -
a8 | G A ARD 1000 | TN |$  1200|$  12,000.00 $ - $ $ - $ -
a9 | D o 1000 | TN [$  1200|$ 1200000 $ - $ $ - $ -
B0 | DG R D 1000 | TN |$  1200|$  12,000.00 $ - $ $ - $ -
S 1500 | TN [$  2400|$ 3600000 $ - $ $  1135| $ 17,025.00 $ -
52 | 6 DECS R AL 1500 | TN |$  2400|$  36,000.00 $ - $ $ - $ -
S 1500 | TN [$  1800|$ 27,0000 $ - $ $ - $ -
Ba | D v MP277 1500 | TN |$  2000|$  30,000.00 $ - $ $ - $ -
55 s e A LLEN 500 |TN|$ 2000 $ 10,000.00 $ - $ $ - $ -
E N 500 [TN|$ 3000 $ 15000.00 $ - $ $ - $ -
T AN AL 500 |TN|$ 2800 $ 14,000.00 $ - $ $ - $ -
B8 | A O oN 1000 | TN |$  2800|$ 28,000.00 $ - $ $ - $ -
B0 P R e TO 1000 | TN [$  3000|$ 3000000 $ - $ $ - $ -
60 |DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL 1000 | TN |$ 3000|$ 30,000.00 $ - $ $ - $ -

HWY2 MP183 1MI W OF MULLEN
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Buyer: Brenda Sensibaugh AMENDED Opening Date: 02/06/20
6203 OF
Department of Transportation

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, and

3}* -
2 Surfacing Gravel Pine Bluffs Gravel & Exc Inc Simon Contractors Stalp Gravel, Inc. Ulrich Gravel Inc Westover Rock & Sand Inc
)

Description Qty UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price E);erir::ied Unit Price E);erir::ied Unit Price EXS‘;?CZEd

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
51 |Hwy97 MP9 12MI N OF N PLATTE 2000 | TN |$  1200] $  24,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
62 HWY23 MP56 DICKENS 2000 TN [ $ 1200 $ 24,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ N

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
63 GOTHENBURG YARD 750 TN [ $ 13.00| $ 9,750.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
64 ANSLEY HWY183 MP89 750 TN [ $ 2400| $ 18,000.00 $ - $ -8 11.35| $ 8,512.50 $ -

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
55 | SARGENT YARD 750 [TN|$ 2500 $ 18,750.00 $ - $ -|s 1010|s 757500 $ .

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
66 OCONTO JCT HWY21 AND 40 750 TN [ $ 2400| $ 18,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
57 |ARNOLD HWY92 MP251 375 |TN|$ 1800($  6750.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
68 | ANSELMO HWY2 MP257 750 TN |$ 2400|$ 18,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ R

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
59 |BROKEN BOW HWY21 MP68 750 |TN]$ 2000 $ 15000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
70 HWY2 AT DUNNING 750 TN [ $ 2400| $ 18,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
71 HWY25 MP104 AT SUTHERLAND 2000 TN [ $ 1200 $ 24,000.00| $ 17.53| $  35,060.00 $ - $ - $ -

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
72 LEXINGTON YARD 750 TN [ $ 2400| $ 18,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
73 |HwY2 MP183 1M W OF MULLEN 2500 [ TN |$ 2000 $ 50000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
74 HWY92 MP205 2MI E TYRON 2000 TN [ $ 18.00| $  36,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ N

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
> |HwY83 MP130 18MI N STAPLETON 1000 ] TN |$  2200] $  22,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
76 |HwY92 MP225 3MI W OF STAPLETON 500 | TN|$ 22001 $ 11,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
"7 |AwWY2 MP176 10MI W OF MULLEN 1000 ] TN |$  2000] $  20,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ -

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
78 | Y61 MP126 1M1 N ARTHUR 1000 | TN [$  2200($ 2200000 $ 1445 $ 14,450.00 $ - $ - $ ;

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
79 HWY61 MP175 13MI N OF HYANNIS 1000 TN [ $ 22.00| $ 22,000.00( $ 22301 $ 22,300.00 $ - $ - $ -

DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL
80 | Y6l MP131 7MI N ARTHUR 1000 | TN [$  2200($ 2200000($ 1554|$ 15540.00 $ - $ - $ ;

DIST 7 SURFACING GRAVEL
81 |Hwy23 MP131 W END OF ELWOOD 1150 | TN $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL

82 || jWY6 MP10 13MI W OF IMPERIAL 700 | TN $ -|$ 18343 1283800 $ , $ R s i

DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
83 |SPRINGVIEW YARD 800 | TN $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
84 | ANSWORTH YARD 1500 | TN $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL

85 |VALENTINE YARD 2000 | TN $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL

86 |copy vaRD 500 | TN $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -

a7 |DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL 2000 | 1 s - s - s - s - . -

MERRIMAN YARD

Y e R N o - - - T
B S S I S S B E R
90 35&%@2&‘&%@:& HWY281 700 | TN $ - $ - $ - $ - $ .
9L | B RWELL SOUTH YARD 1000 | TN $ - $ - $ -|s  1175| $ 11,75000 $ -

DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
92 BARTLETT YARD 2000 TN $ - $ - $ -8 10.95| $ 21,900.00 $ -

DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL
% |7AYLOR YARD 1000 | TN $ - $ - $ -|s  1175| s 1175000 s ;
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Buyer: Brenda Sensibaugh

AMENDED
6203 OF

Department of Transportation

Armor Coat Gravel, Deicing Gravel, Windrow Gravel, and

z Surfacing Gravel Pine Bluffs Gravel & Exc Inc Simon Contractors Stalp Gravel, Inc. Ulrich Gravel Inc Westover Rock & Sand Inc
3
Description Qty UOM| Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price E);erir::ied Unit Price E);erir::ied Unit Price EXS‘;?CZEd
51 [T DECHG GRAVEL =K s - s - s - s s
R e 00 [ s s N s E
o6 |57 8 WINDROW GRAVEL w00 | s - s - s s N
o7 E@igomragfziolvh\nq%g\é%mmmm 200 | TN $ - $ 3 $ 3 $ - $ B
ol A EEE s s . s N
DR s Ve IR s s N s E
100 aﬁzgs\flmgzig\gfgé\r/\%m 350 ™ $ 3 $ 3 $ 3 $ 3 $ 3
101 [ R L L 700 | TN $ - $ - $ -|s  1175|'s 822500 $ -
2 [o5 RO oo | s s N s N
e A I s s N s E
104 35550%50@%%@5&ENT.NE 1200 | TN $ 3 $ 3 $ 3 $ 3 $ 3
105 | O 200 | TN $ s oasls 3800|$ 020|$ 4000[$  015|$  30.00 $ -
106 [OPTION 2 DELVERY COSTPER TON | 05 | 7y s s om|s o s |s oms|s s s -
107 |G O R O e TON 200 | TN $ s oasls 38.00 $ -|s  ois|s 3000 $ -
108 | O e N 200 | TN $ - s - s -|s  ois|s 3000 s -
108 [ R EELEY 1200 | TN $ - $ - $ -|'s 1275| s 1530000 $ -
Total $2,075.750.00 $1.192,512.00 $ 37,540.00 $170,057.50 $69.750.00
Payment Terms 100 90
Delivery Days ARO 60 Per ITB 30 As needed

Comments

Lines 105-108 ar per ton mile

Line 105 is per ton/mile
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